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Freedom of Information Request 
 
Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request. 
 
Request / Response: 
 
1. How many adults (18-65) with a learning disability are in hospital settings? 
 
 There are 6 people with a learning disability in hospital settings. Of these 3 
 are commissioned by NHS Knowsley CCG and 3 are commissioned by NHS 
 England Specialised Commissioning Team. 
 
2. For how many adults in Question 1 is there a discharge plan in place with 

identified provision? 
 
 There are 3 adults from question 1 with a discharge plan in place with 
 identified provision. 
 
3. What is the average weekly fee for the placements in Question 2? 

  
The average weekly fee for patients with a discharge plan who are 
commissioned by NHS Knowsley CCG is £3629  

The CCG does not hold this information for those patients who are 
commissioned by NHS England. NHS Knowsley CCG would advise that you 
contact NHS England directly to request this information. Contact details for 
NHS England are- 

NHS England  

PO Box 16738   
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Redditch  

B97 9PT 

 Email requests should be sent to england.contactus@nhs.net (Please write 
 “Freedom of Information” in the subject line). 

 If you would have difficulty  making a written request, please call the Customer 
 Contact Centre on 0300 311 22 33.  

4.  For how many adults in Question 1 is the person ready for discharge, but no 
 suitable provider has been identified? 

There is 1 adult in Question 1 who is ready for discharge, but no suitable 
provider has been identified.  

 
5. What is the average weekly fee for the placements in Question 4? 

 
The weekly fee is £2,625. 

 
6. For how many adults in Question 1 is there no discharge plan in place, as the 

person isn't ready for discharge? 
 
 There are 2 adults in Question 1 where there is no discharge plan in place, as 
 the patient is not ready for discharge. 
  

7. What is the average weekly fee for the placements in Question 6? 
 
 The CCG does not hold this information. Placements for these patients are 
 commissioned by NHS England. NHS Knowsley CCG would  advise that you 
 contact NHS England directly to request this information. Contact details for 
 NHS England were supplied in the response to Question 3. 
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